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Abstract The landscape has dramatically changed for
patients seeking treatment for rapid ejaculation. Previ-
ously, psychotherapy or behavioral treatment was con-
sidered to be the treatment of choice for this troubling
sexual dysfunction. Since the early 1990s, an efficacious
alternative treatment has emerged—the off-label
administration of SSRI medications. Currently, several
short-acting SSRI compounds are in phase III clinical
trials and are likely to receive approval as the first
medical treatment for rapid ejaculation. Given the pre-
sumed efficacy of these new compounds and the off-label
use of the current SSRIs, one might conclude that psy-
chotherapy\behavior therapy for rapid ejaculation is an
obsolete and antiquated intervention. On the contrary,
psychotherapy is now more relevant than ever. The two
aims of this paper are to review psychological/behav-
ioral therapies for rapid ejaculation and to discuss the
important role of combined psychological and medical
treatment. In the new age of SSRI treatment for rapid
ejaculation, some form of psychological/behavioral
intervention is essential to help patients/couples make
better use of medical therapies, to learn skills to delay
ejaculation once off medication, to bolster sexual confi-
dence, and to enhance patient and partner sexual satis-
faction.
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Introduction

The landscape has dramatically changed for patients
seeking treatment for rapid ejaculation. Previously,
psychotherapy or behavioral treatment were considered
to be the treatment of choice for this troubling sexual
dysfunction. In the early 1990s, clinicians began suc-
cessfully experimenting with the off-label administration
of selective serotonergic reuptake inhibitors (SSRIs) to
delay ejaculatory latency [27]. Presently, several novel,
short-acting SSRI compounds are in phase III clinical
trials and are likely to receive approval as the first
medical treatments for rapid ejaculation.

Thus, physicians may soon have an approved, simple,
efficacious and safe intervention that delays ejaculatory
latency. Given the efficacy of SSRIs, one might conclude
that psychotherapy\behavior therapy for rapid ejacula-
tion is an obsolete and antiquated intervention. On the
contrary, psychotherapy is now more relevant than ever.

These days, delaying men’s ejaculatory latency is
relatively straightforward, restoring their sexual confi-
dence and reversing the impact on the relationships is
more complicated [26]. One of the lessons learned from
the PDE5 revolution for the treatment of ejaculatory
dysfunction (ED) was that no matter how efficacious
and safe the medical intervention, by itself, medication
could not surmount all the psychosocial obstacles that
maintained the dysfunction and interfered with sexual
life [3, 4].

In the new age of SSRI treatment for rapid ejacula-
tion, some adjunctive form of psychological/behavioral
intervention is essential to help patients/couples make
better use of medical therapies and to lessen the high
discontinuation rates due to psychosocial factors. Psy-
chotherapy is useful either in its traditional form as the
sole intervention for men or couples with rapid ejacu-
lation or, in an updated rendering, as an integral aspect
of a combined or integrated biopsychosocial interven-
tion [2]. Psychotherapy in the context of an integrated
treatment is often short-term, directive, educational and
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targeted at helping couples overcome their resistances to
making use of a medical treatment.

The two aims of this paper are to review psycholog-
ical/behavioral therapies for rapid ejaculation and to
discuss the important role of combined psychological
and medical treatment.

The goals of traditional psychotherapy

Psychotherapy/behavioral interventions improve ejacu-
latory control by helping men/couples to: (1) learn
techniques to control and/or delay ejaculation, (2) gain
confidence in their sexual performance, (3) lessen per-
formance anxiety, (4) modify rigid sexual repertoires,
(5) surmount barriers to intimacy, (6) resolve interper-
sonal issues that precipitate and maintain the dysfunc-
tion, (7) come to terms with feelings/thoughts that
interfere with sexual function, and (8) increase com-
munication [1, 2].

Psychodynamically oriented therapists view the dys-
function as a metaphor in which the man/couple are
trying to simultaneously conceal and express conflicting
aspects of themselves or the relationship. In symbolic
terms, the dysfunction contains a compromised solution
to one of life’s dilemmas. Alternatively, behavior ther-
apists understand the dysfunction as a conditioned re-
sponse or a maladaptive response to interpersonal or
environmental occurrences.

Combined treatment-coaching

The psychological aspects of a combined medical/psy-
chological treatment are different from psychotherapy
alone and are generally referred to as coaching. Such
interventions are more directive, advice giving, educa-
tional and technique oriented. They target the psycho-
social obstacles created after the onset of the dysfunction
such as: avoidance of foreplay, restrictive sexual patterns
that are resented by partners, unwillingness to discuss
the problem which itself creates a barrier, etc. The goals
of coaching include: (1) identifying and working through
the resistances to medical interventions that lead to
premature discontinuation, (2) reducing or eliminating
performance anxiety, (3) gaining sexual confidence, (4)
understanding the context in which men/couples make
love, and (4) helping them to modify maladaptive sexual
scripts.

What makes therapy work?

Donahey and Miller [7] report that regardless of the
therapeutic modality (individual, couple or group
therapy). or the specific therapy goals, there are
several common factors that make psychotherapy
effective.

1. Empowering the patient to experience themselves as
having the ability to create change and impact con-
textual factors.

2. The patient/therapist relationship is critical to suc-
cessful therapeutic outcome. The therapist must be
able to assess and accommodate to the patient’s
readiness for change and provide a safe and empathic
environment where the patient can explore obstacles,
choices and meanings of his psychological and
behavioral dilemmas.

3. The role of hopefulness and realistic expectancy
should be provided in psychotherapy.

Psychotherapy for rapid ejaculation

Present day psychotherapy for rapid ejaculation is an
integration of psychodynamic, systems, behavioral, and
cognitive approaches within a short-term psychotherapy
model [13, 15, 18, 20, 28]. The guiding principles of
treatment are to learn to control ejaculation while
understanding the meaning of the symptom and the
context in which it occurs.

Men fear focusing on their sexual excitement,
believing it will cause them to ejaculate even more
quickly. They attempt to diminish or limit their sexual
excitement by resorting to wearing multiple condoms,
applying desensitization ointment to the penis, repeat-
edly masturbating prior to intercourse, not allowing
partners to stimulate them, or distracting themselves by
performing complex mathematical computations while
making love. These tactics, however creative, curtail the
pleasures of lovemaking and are generally unsuccessful.

These men typically describe themselves as having
two points on their subjective excitement scale—no
excitement and the point of ejaculatory inevitability.
They fail to focus on their arousal and are unable to
perceive or linger in mid-range sexual excitement.

In treatment, men are instructed to focus on their
sexual arousal. By utilizing graduated behavioral exer-
cises, they are taught to identify and become familiar
with intermediate levels of sexual excitement. Succes-
sively, beginning with masturbation and moving pro-
gressively through foreplay and intercourse, they master
the ability to linger in this range, thereby delaying
ejaculation.

In addition to teaching the men sexual skills and
resolving the interpersonal and intrapsychic issues re-
lated to rapid ejaculation, it is also helpful to address the
cognitive distortions that help maintain the dysfunction.
Rosen et al. [23] list eight forms of cognitive distortions
that may interfere with sexual function. These include:
(1) all or nothing thinking, e.g., ‘‘I am a complete failure
because I come quickly’’, (2) overgeneralization, e.g., ‘‘If
I had trouble controlling my ejaculation last night, I
won’t be able to this morning’’, (3) disqualifying the
positive, e.g. ‘‘My partner says our lovemaking is satis-
fying because she doesn’t want to hurt my feelings’’, (4)
mind reading, e.g. ‘‘I don’t need to ask, I know how she
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felt about last night’’, (5) fortune telling, e.g., ‘‘I am sure
things will go badly tonight’’, (6) emotional reasoning,
e.g. ‘‘Because a man feels something is true, it must be’’,
(7) categorical imperatives, i.e., shoulds, ought to and
musts dominate the man’s cognitive processes, and (8)
catastrophizing, e.g., ‘‘If I fail tonight my girlfriend will
dump me’’.

Psychoeducational interventions also aim to rework
the behavioral repertoire of the man or couple, referred
to as their sexual script [8]. Men with rapid ejaculation
limit foreplay because they fear becoming too excited.
Sex becomes very mechanical and rigid; yet these solu-
tions do not help the man to delay ejaculation. By
modifying rigid and narrow scripts therapists may help
couples establish a more satisfying sexual life.

Psychotherapy outcome studies

Evidenced-based medicine has become the gold standard
for judging the efficacy of psychological or medical
interventions. Studies at the highest level of evidence
based medicine require moderate to large sample sizes
with designs being randomized, placebo-controlled and
double-blinded. The majority of psychotherapy treat-
ment outcome studies can be characterized as uncon-
trolled, unblinded trials; none meet the requirements for
high level evidenced-based studies. What exists in the
literature are reports on small to moderately sized co-
horts of subjects who received different forms of psy-
chological interventions with limited or no follow-up. In
most studies, active treatment was not compared to
placebo, control or wait list groups. These studies are
summarized below.

Since the early 1970s, an array of individual, conjoint,
and group therapy approaches employing behavioral
strategies such as stop-start [16] or squeeze techniques
[24] have been used to treat rapid ejaculation [11, 13, 15,
18].

Masters and Johnson [16] reported on 186 men who
were seen in their quasi-residential model utilizing mul-
tiple treatment techniques including the squeeze tech-
nique sensate focus, individual and conjoint therapy as
well as sexual skills and communication training. They
reported ‘‘failure rates’’ of 2.2% and 2.7% immediately
post-therapy and at a 5-year follow-up respectively.
Never before, or since has any clinical center been able
to replicate either the initial, or post-treatment, efficacy
rates reported by Masters and Johnson [10, 12, 14, 25].
For example, only 64% of men in Hawton et al.’s [10]
study were characterized as successful in overcoming
rapid ejaculation immediately post-therapy [5, 6, 10].

All studies with long-term follow-up noted a ten-
dency for men to suffer relapses. In writing about the
problem of relapse in treating all forms of sexual dys-
function, Hawton et al. [9] reported that recurrence of or
continuing difficulty with the presenting sexual problem
was commonly being reported by 75% of couples; this
caused little to no concern for 34%. Patients indicated

that they discussed the difficulty with the partner,
practiced the techniques learned during therapy, ac-
cepted that difficulties were likely to recur, and read
books about sexuality.

The concept of relapse prevention has begun to be
incorporated into sex therapy. McCarthy [17], in dis-
cussing relapse prevention, suggests that therapists
schedule periodic ‘‘booster or maintenance’’ sessions
following termination. Patients remark that knowing
that they will be seen again in 6 months keeps them on
target because they know they will have ‘‘to report’’ on
their progress. The follow-up sessions can also be used
to work out any ‘‘glitches’’ that have interfered with
their progress.

Combined therapy-coaching

The concept of integrating a talking therapy with a
medical treatment seems like a radical departure from
the traditional treatment of rapid ejaculation. Typically,
patients come either to the urologist’s or the mental
health clinician’s office, but not both. However, in other
specialties, psychiatry for example, combined therapy is
the most efficacious treatment for a variety of disorders
and is often performed by two therapists [21].

One of the misconceptions regarding combined
therapy or coaching is that it would require a mental
health clinician to come to the urologist’s office or the
patient to make a separate appointment with the sex
therapist. While this would be ideal, it is not practical
and is unlikely to occur. However, coaching can be
conducted by the physician or his/her nurse. It requires
someone who has time, interest, interpersonal sensitiv-
ity, minimal training in sex therapy (i.e. teaching tech-
niques to delay ejaculation), and an appreciation of the
relevant psychosocial issues that may interfere with
medical treatment.

There is growing support for the paradigm of com-
bined treatment. McMahon and colleagues [19] in their
recommendations from the 2nd International Consul-
tation on Sexual Dysfunction in Men and Women, list
combination therapy as a first line intervention for life-
long or acquired rapid ejaculation. Independently, Alt-
hof [2] and Perelman [22] have also written about this
intervention.

There are several cogent reasons to consider coaching
as a vital aspect of the treatment of rapid ejaculation.
First, men want to be able to delay ejaculation by
themselves (without medication) but have not learned
the skills to do so. Coaching would teach men the
behavioral skills of ejaculatory delay as they are weaned
from pharmacotherapy. Second, some couples will have
a difficult time surmounting the barriers built in re-
sponse to the psychosocial consequences of the dys-
function. With the caring support and direction of a
neutral party these difficulties can often be overcome.
Third, combination therapy would help to establish or
restore sexual self-confidence as well as diminish
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performance anxiety. Fourth, partners will feel freer to
engage in extended foreplay or to broaden their sexual
repertoire leading to greater satisfaction for both.

Conclusion

To be effective in enabling patients to make love, clini-
cians need to broaden their perspective from genital
function to appreciating the context in which couples
live. Outcomes conceived solely in terms of ejaculatory
delay or control are far too narrow and mechanistic.
Successful sexuality outcomes require attending to the
complex interplay between the biological, psychological
and relational components of individuals’ and couples’
lives.

While clinicians will soon have safe, effective phar-
maceutical interventions available to delay ejaculation,
the couples formidable psychosocial barriers may
diminish the treatment outcome. By providing patients
with an integrated medical/psychological treatment
aimed at overcoming these barriers clinicians are likely
to significantly increase the effectiveness of their treat-
ment interventions. Psychotherapy in its traditional
form remains a viable alternative for men who do not
wish pharmacotherapy. Combined therapy is likely to
improve treatment satisfaction, compliance, and help
couples make better use of an effective medical inter-
vention.
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